

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

13-1400

PROPOSAL FOR: **Purchase of Cisco Routers & APC UPS Equipment Requirements for I.S. Scada Transport Project**
 TIME & DATE: **3:00 PM January 31, 2013**

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY																	
ITEM	DESCRIPTION																	
1	GROUP 1. Cisco Routers 15 each Cisco CGR2010 Security Bundle w/SEC license PAK Part Number: CGR-2010-SEC/K9	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	2,700.35 40,505.25	3,296.00 49,440.00	2,738.56 41,078.40	2,851.75 42,776.25	3,057.00 45,855.00	3,174.24 47,613.60	3,266.16 48,992.40	3,459.98 51,899.70	NO BID	GROUP 1 NOT TABULATED NON-RESPONSIVE	GROUP 1 NOT TABULATED NON-RESPONSIVE	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
2	15 each EtherSwitch 8x 10/100T (4 PoE) ports + 2 100/1000 SFP (Subcomponent of Cisco CGR2010) Part Number: GRWIC-D-ES-2S-8PC	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	1,378.00 20,670.00	1,693.00 25,395.00	1,397.50 20,962.50	1,383.50 20,752.50	1,560.00 23,400.00	1,619.85 24,297.75	1,666.74 25,001.10	1,869.98 28,049.70	NO BID							
3	30 each High AC/DC (88-300VDC/85-264VAC) Pwr Sup for CGR2010/CGS2520 Part Number: PWR-RGD-AC-DC	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	371.00 11,130.00	558.00 16,740.00	558.25 16,747.50	379.50 11,385.00	420.00 12,600.00	461.16 13,834.80	641.88 19,256.40	519.99 15,599.70	NO BID							
4	15 each SMARTNET 8X5XNBD Cisco CGR2010 front/rear cabling w/2GE Part Number: CON-SNT-C2010SEC	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	396.24 5,943.60	442.00 6,630.00	273.05 4,095.75	589.75 8,846.25	453.00 6,795.00	478.37 7,175.55	441.62 6,624.30	546.98 8,204.70	NO BID							
5	20 each Cisco 892F 2 GE/SFP High Perf Security Router Part Number: C892FSP-K9	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	792.35 15,847.00	982.00 19,640.00	803.56 16,071.20	796.47 15,929.40	897.00 17,940.00	931.70 18,634.00	958.38 19,167.60	1,116.98 22,339.60	NO BID							
6	20 each Rackmount kit for 890 Part Number: ACS-890-RM-19	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	53.00 1,060.00	68.00 1,360.00	53.75 1,075.00	55.00 1,100.00	60.00 1,200.00	68.79 1,375.80	60.89 1,217.80	73.98 1,479.60	NO BID							
	TOTAL FOR GROUP 1		95,155.85	119,205.00	100,030.35	100,789.40	107,790.00	112,931.50	120,259.60	127,573.00	NO BID							
7	GROUP 2. Cisco Routers 13 each Rack-mount Transfer Switches Rack ATS, 100-120V, 15A, 5-15P In, (10) 5-15R Out Part Number: AP7750A	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	545.36 7,089.68	560.00 7,280.00	592.05 7,696.65	665.00 8,645.00	516.00 6,708.00	568.21 7,386.73	596.56 7,755.28	559.98 7,279.74	551.00 7,163.00	597.40 7,766.20	535.00 6,955.00	544.02 7,072.26	679.00 8,827.00	GROUP 2 NOT TABULATED NON-RESPONSIVE	BID NOT TABULATED NON-RESOIBSUVE	BID NOT TABULATED NON-RESOIBSUVE
8	13 each APC Smart-UPS XL 2200VA 120V Tower/Rack Convertible Part Number: SUA2200XL	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	987.69 12,839.97	958.00 12,454.00	1,078.29 14,017.77	1,195.00 15,535.00	1,016.00 13,208.00	1,042.60 13,553.80	1,081.41 14,058.33	1,189.98 15,469.74	1,055.00 13,715.00	1,062.20 13,808.60	1,089.00 14,157.00	1,108.08 14,405.04	1,197.50 15,567.50			
9	13 each APC Smart-UPS XL 48V Battery Pack Tower/Rack Convertible Part Number: SUA48XLBP	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	530.95 6,902.35	527.00 6,851.00	585.57 7,612.41	601.80 7,823.40	547.00 7,111.00	611.65 7,951.45	606.88 7,889.44	606.98 7,890.74	566.00 7,358.00	582.20 7,568.60	611.00 7,943.00	607.94 7,903.22	643.75 8,368.75			
10	13 each UPS Network Management Card 2 Part Number: AP9630	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	213.41 2,774.33	220.00 2,860.00	231.42 3,008.46	295.00 3,835.00	221.00 2,873.00	245.47 3,191.11	229.08 2,978.04	239.90 3,118.70	216.00 2,808.00	246.20 3,200.60	228.00 2,964.00	234.29 3,045.77	258.75 3,363.75			
	TOTAL FOR GROUP2		29,606.33	29,445.00	32,335.29	35,838.40	29,900.00	32,083.09	32,681.09	33,758.92	31,044.00	32,344.00	32,019.00	32,426.29	36,127.00			
	GRAND TOTAL		124,762.18	148,650.00	132,365.64	136,627.80	137,690.00	145,014.59	152,940.69	161,331.92	Group 2 31,044.00	Group 2 32,344.00	Group 2 32,019.00	Group 2 32,426.29	Group 2 36,127.00			
	Terms		Net 30 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days	2% 10 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days	0.5% 10 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days			
	Delivery Days		14-21 days	Group 1: 60 Group 2: 14	30 days	60 days	20 days	30 days	30 days	15 days	7 days	3-4 days	5 days	5 days				

* **LOW BIDDER**

BID INVITATIONS MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

World Wide Technology Inc.
 DLT SOLUTIONS
 ePlus Technology
 Computer Solutions
 Freeit Data Solutions Inc
 Immix Technology Inc.
 Lumenate
 Sigma Solutions
 Solutions II

TechDepot by Office Depot
 INX LLC (A PRESIDIO Company)
 CDW-G
 Genesis Networks, Inc
 Flair Data Systems
 NETSYNC SOLUTION
 Storage Assessments, Inc.
 Virtual Enterprises, Inc. Dba: Advanced Systems Group
 VION